
Lapeer County Road Commission

2025-11 EQUIPMENT RENTAL RATE PROPOSAL
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Wheel Loader Volvo220 / Cat 980 8yd $ 250.00 $ 200.00 $ 1,600.00 $ 5,000.00 $ 15,000.00 $ 15,000.00

Wheel Loader Volvo 120 4yd $ 175.00 $ 125.00 $ 1,000.00 $ 3,250.00 $ 9,000.00 $ 9,000.00

Wheel Loader John Deere 544 2.5yd $ 150.00 $ 100.00 $ 800.00 $ 2,500.00 $ 7,250.00 $ 7,250.00

I.D.F. Deck Screen Tesab 1550 5x16 $ 250.00 $ 250.00 $ 2,500.00 $ 6,500.00 $ 18,000.00 $ 18,000.00

Cleanup Deck Screen Tesab 2600 5X20 $ 250.00 $ 250.00 $ 3,000.00 $ 6,500.00 $ 19,000.00 $ 19,000.00

810-724-0006 Tracked Stacking Con. Bradford 36x80 36x80 $ 100.00 $ 100.00 $ 1,000.00 $ 2,750.00 $ 8,000.00 $ 8,000.00

Semi with gravel trains Various Various Various $ 165.00 $ 165.00 $ 1,200.00 $ 6,000.00 $ 24,000.00 $ 24,000.00

Semi with lead Various Various Various $ 135.00 $ 135.00 $ 1,000.00 $ 5,000.00 $ 20,000.00 $ 20,000.00

Trommel Screen McCloskey 621 6x21 $ 250.00 $ 250.00 $ 3,500.00 $ 6,500.00 $ 18,000.00 $ 18,000.00

Wheeled Skidsteer John Deere 332 10,000lbs $ 110.00 $ 60.00 $ 400.00 $ 1,200.00 $ 3,600.00 $ 3,600.00

Track Skidsteer CAT 287 / Deere 329 10,000lbs $ 135.00 $ 85.00 $ 500.00 $ 1,750.00 $ 5,250.00 $ 5,250.00

Mini Excavator Bobcat E42 10000lbs $ 125.00 $ 75.00 $ 400.00 $ 1,200.00 $ 3,600.00 $ 3,600.00

Mini Track Skidsteer BobCat MT85 4,00lb $ 105.00 $ 55.00 $ 275.00 $ 825.00 $ 2,475.00 $ 2,475.00

Excavator Volvo 350 75,000lb $ 275.00 $ 225.00 $ 1,500.00 $ 4,250.00 $ 11,500.00 $ 11,500.00

Excavator Volvo 140 30,000lb $ 150.00 $ 100.00 $ 650.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 6,000.00 $ 6,000.00

Excavator Volvo 210 45,000lb $ 175.00 $ 125.00 $ 1,000.00 $ 2,800.00 $ 7,500.00 $ 7,500.00

Genertor Multiquip 15kw 15kw $ 85.00 $ 85.00 $ 200.00 $ 500.00 $ 1,500.00 $ 1,500.00

Dozer JD 650 24000lb $ 155.00 $ 105.00 $ 600.00 $ 1,850.00 $ 5,500.00 $ 5,500.00

Dozer JD 550 20000lb $ 125.00 $ 75.00 $ 450.00 $ 1,600.00 $ 4,400.00 $ 4,400.00

Dozer JD 850 35000lb $ 195.00 $ 145.00 $ 1,500.00 $ 4,500.00 $ 12,000.00 $ 12,000.00

Long Reach Excavator JD 350 70,000lb $ 250.00 $ 200.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 6,000.00 $ 18,000.00 $ 18,000.00

Roller Ingersoll SD 70 Smooth Drum $ 100.00 $ 50.00 $ 400.00 $ 1,500.00 $ 4,500.00 $ 4,500.00

Stone Slinger Volvo Dahms 18.5 ton $ 200.00 $ 200.00 $ 1,600.00 $ 8,000.00 $ 32,000.00 $ 32,000.00

Articulating Dump Truck Moxy MT-30 30 Ton $ 150.00 $ 100.00 $ 800.00 $ 2,400.00 $ 7,200.00 $ 7,200.00

Truck/Lowboy Peterbilt Trail King 50 ton $ 145.00 $ 125.00 $ 1,000.00 $ 5,000.00 $ 20,000.00 $ 20,000.00

Light Tower Terex RL 4 7.5 $ 105.00 $ 65.00 $ 125.00 $ 400.00 $ 1,200.00 $ 1,200.00

Excavator Volvo ECR88 18,000lb $ 135.00 $ 85.00 $ 500.00 $ 1,500.00 $ 4,500.00 $ 4,500.00

Excavator Volvo ECR145 30,000lb $ 155.00 $ 105.00 $ 700.00 $ 2,200.00 $ 6,200.00 $ 6,200.00

Excavator Volvo 160 35,000lb $ 165.00 $ 115.00 $ 750.00 $ 2,350.00 $ 7,050.00 $ 7,050.00
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Wheel Loader Cat 980 8 yard $ 225.00 No Bid No Bid $ 5,000.00 $ 15,000.00 $ 15,000.00

Wheel Loader Cat 938 4 yard $ 150.00 No Bid $ 1,200.00 $ 4,000.00 $ 12,500.00 $ 12,500.00

Bob Wheel Loader Cat 972 7 yard $ 200.00 No Bid $ 1,400.00 $ 4,500.00 $ 14,000.00 $ 14,000.00

 Alexander Skidsteer Cat 262D $ 125.00 No Bid $ 800.00 $ 1,500.00 $ 4,000.00 $ 4,000.00

810-346-2567 Skidsteer Track Cat 299 D3 275 $ 130.00 No Bid $ 850.00 $ 1,800.00 $ 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00

Excavator Cat 326F $ 150.00 No Bid $ 1,200.00 $ 4,000.00 $ 7,500.00 $ 7,500.00

Dozer Cat D5 $ 150.00 No Bid $ 1,200.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 6,000.00 $ 6,000.00

KW - Lowboy Trailer 50 Ton $ 150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

KW Tractor w/Supertrain 54 ton $ 160.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

KW Tractor w/aluminum 

lead
32 ton $ 140.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

KW Tractor w/steel lead $ 140.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

KW Tractor w/steel train $ 160.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

KW Tractor w/Flowboy $ 170.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Astec Asphalt Road Widener RW195D $ 190.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Inc. Ride on Broom - Broce $ 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

810.346.2092 Rubber Tire Roller - Hyster $ 103.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Skidsteer with bucket - 

Bobcat 870
$ 125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Backhoe JD 310J No Bid No Bid $ 345.00 $ 1,350.00 $ 3,350.00 No Bid

Dozer w/Cab and air JD 550J LT No Bid No Bid $ 395.00 $ 1,650.00 $ 3,650.00 No Bid

M-Nolan Dozer w/Cab and air JD 650JLT No Bid No Bid $ 495.00 $ 1,980.00 $ 3,950.00 No Bid

Farms Tracked Skidsteer JD 325G No Bid No Bid $ 300.00 $ 1,200.00 $ 3,000.00 No Bid

810-245-6085 Mini Excavator JD 35G No Bid No Bid $ 285.00 $ 1,140.00 $ 2,350.00 No Bid

Mini Excavator JD 50G No Bid No Bid $ 385.00 $ 1,540.00 $ 3,450.00 No Bid

Excavator JD 130G No Bid No Bid $ 595.00 $ 2,380.00 $ 4,950.00 No Bid

Excavator JD 200D LC No Bid No Bid $ 785.00 $ 2,550.00 $ 6,250.00 No Bid

Telescoping Forklift Genie GTH844 No Bid No Bid $ 395.00 $ 1,650.00 $ 3,650.00 No Bid

Roller Ingersol SD45D No Bid No Bid $ 395.00 $ 1,650.00 $ 3,650.00 No Bid

Broom Broce RS350 No Bid No Bid $ 395.00 $ 1,650.00 $ 3,650.00 No Bid

Compact Tactor JD 4X4, Diesel No Bid No Bid $ 195.00 $ 745.00 $ 1,495.00 No Bid
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Dozer CAT D4 $ 125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Excavator CAT 315C $ 125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Service Truck and Trailer Sterling $ 65.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

T.G. Priehs Pickup truck various 1/2 ton-3/4 ton $ 35.00 No Bid $ 200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

810-721-2600 Roller HAMM 48" asphalt roller $ 85.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Roller bomag bw900-50 asphalt roller $ 55.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Roller cat CB34B asphalt roller $ 90.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 wheel Roller Hyster C530A $ 105.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Grader Volvo G720B 14' Blade $ 175.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Road Widener Blaw Knox 195c $ 190.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Backhoe CAT 430 $ 125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Skidsteer w bucket Bobcat A770 $ 120.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ride on Broom Waldon Sweep Master 8' broom $ 105.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Mill Attachment Bobcat 2' Wide $ 35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sweeper Attachment Bobcat $ 35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Truck with Lowboy Trailer Peterbilt 50 ton $ 190.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Loader CAT 950G $ 125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tac Truck Sterling 500 Gallon $ 105.00 plus material No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Small grader 8" $ 95.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Dozer Cat D8K $ 160.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Dozer Cat D7 $ 145.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Marlette Dozer Cat D7 with rome disk $ 175.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Excavating Excavator Cat 320 $ 140.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Company Excavtor Cat 336F $ 200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

989-635-2998 Excavator Cat 336F W/Conveyor $ 300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Excavator Cat 225 $ 120.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Excavator Cat 235 $ 155.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Excavator Cat 235D $ 180.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Excavator Cat 235D w/extension $ 200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Continued: Dragline NW 41 50' or 65' boom $ 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Off Road Trucks Terex 2766B $ 135.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Off Road Trucks Cat 730 $ 140.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Grader Cat 140G $ 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Continued: Tractor JD 970 w/attachments $ 65.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Backhoe Cat 416B $ 80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tractor Trailer w/gravel 

train aluminum
$ 155.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tractor Trailer w/gravel 

train steel boxes
$ 160.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tractor Trailer w/lead 

aluninum
$ 140.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tractor Trailer w/lead steel $ 145.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Marlette Loader Komatsu WA400 $ 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Excavating Roller Hypac C747B 3-5 Ton $ 55.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Company Roller Rosco 1 Ton $ 55.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

989-635-2998 Roller Cat 534 10 Ton $ 110.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Labor  $ 55.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vac Truck Vactor $ 125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sweeper Elign $ 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Lowboy Hyster $ 125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Trailer Interstate $ 60.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Crane Manitowoc 2900t Series
70 Ton

120' Boom
$ 575.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Roto-Mill/Pavement Profiler  Roadtec RX700e/700 6.5 Feet $ 750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pavement

Recycling
Roto-Mill/Pavement Profiler  Wirtgen 210 Fi/200i 7.3 Feet $ 750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

810-245-5700 Roto-Mill/Pavement Profiler  Wirtgen 2000DC 2,3,4 Feet $ 750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Roto-Mill/Pavement Profiler  Wirtgen W120XTi 3Ft. 11In. $ 750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Continued: Pulverizer/Stabilizer  CMI RS 500; 500B 8 Feet $ 650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pulverizer/Stabilizer
 CMI RS 600; 650; 800; 

950
8 Feet $ 700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pulverizer/Stabilizer  Weiler S 200 6ft 6in $ 600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Asphalt/Cement Stabilizer  P&H 107 12 Feet $ 750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Continued: Asphalt/Cement Stabilizer  P&H 88 8 Feet $ 750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Asphalt/Cement Stabilizer  P&H 58 5 Feet $ 700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pavement

Recycling
Cement/Lime Spreader

 Oshkosh/Internaional 

6WD
8 Feet $ 700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

810-245-5700 Auto Grader  CAT 160H 12 Feet $ 200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Auto Grader  CAT 14M 14 Feet $ 250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Roller- Vibratory Single 

Drum
 HAMM H13i 22 Ton $ 150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Roller- Rubber Tired w/ 

Spray System
 Sakai T2/ T200 20 Ton $ 125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Roller- Vibratory Double 

Drum

 Hamm HD 120i/ Hypac 

778
12 Ton $ 150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Roller- Vibratory Steel/Pad 

Foot
 CAT CP 563 7 Feet $ 150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Water Truck  Peterbuilt/Cat 4,000 Gal $ 150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Lowboy & Tractor  8 Axle $ 200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Truck Tractor  Various Tri Axle $ 150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Dump Trailer  Thru-Way 30 Yard $ 150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tag Trailer  CMI 15 Ton $ 75.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Felling 18 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Felling 30 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Skid Steer  Gehl V 400 82" Bucket $ 125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

96" Broom  96" Broom $ 125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

24" Mill  24" Mill $ 175.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Loader & Forks  CAT 928G 3 Yard $ 175.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Service Truck  99 Ford F-550 $ 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Service Truck w/Crane  2014 Dodge/ 2016 Ford 5500 $ 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Supervisor $ 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Laborer $ 75.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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