

LAPEER COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2020 - 2 Bituminous Mix Materials

ITEMS	Ace-Saginaw Paving Co.	Ajax Materials Corp.	Cadillac Asphalt
	Nathan Gotts	Brian Borich	Deven Rau
	989-755-8147	248-388-1687	248-215-0419
PLANT MIX 13A	Per Ton	Per Ton	Per Ton
PICKED UP	\$61.50	\$72.00	\$75.00
FOB LAPEER	\$70.75	\$107.00	No Bid
FOB NB	\$72.00	\$110.00	No Bid
FOB IC	\$71.75	\$110.00	No Bid
UPM			
PICKED UP	NO BID	\$115.00	\$115.00
FOB LAPEER	NO BID	\$120.00	\$120.00
FOB NB	NO BID	\$125.00	\$120.00
FOB IC	NO BID	\$120.00	\$120.00
QPR 2000			
PICKED UP	\$90.00	No Bid	No Bid
FOB LAPEER	\$105.00	No Bid	No Bid
FOB NB	\$105.00	No Bid	No Bid
FOB IC	\$105.00	No Bid	No Bid
Alternate			
PICKED UP	No Bid	\$105.00	No Bid
FOB LAPEER	No Bid	\$110.00	No Bid
FOB NB	No Bid	\$115.00	No Bid
FOB IMLAY	No Bid	\$110.00	No Bid