
Company Asphalt Materials, Inc Bit Mat Products Michigan Paving & Materials

Contact Clarence Brooks Gary Chapman Russ Milan

Phone 419-693-0626 989-992-9689 517-290-0320

ITEMS

HFRS-2 1.96 2.15 2.40

HFRS-2M 2.36 2.40 No Bid

SS1H 2.16 2.30 2.50

SPECIALTY ITEMS:

PEP No Bid 2.45 No Bid

CSS 1H 2.36 No Bid 2.40

AE 90 1.96 2.20 No Bid

CM-90 No Bid No Bid 2.40

Demurrage Charge After 2 hours 2 hours/9000 gallons minimum 2 hours
Demurrage Per Hour $110.00 $100.00 $100.00

*Hours based on load size
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