

LAPEER COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2017-7 Signs/Part 1

ITEM	Rathco		Dornbos		Osburn Associates		Vulcan Signs			
	UNIT \$	MIN	UNIT\$	MIN	UNIT\$	MIN	UNIT\$	MIN		
	269-323-0153		517-543-4000		800-523-8917		800-633-6845			
12" X 6" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$2.44	5	\$3.75	10	\$1.55		\$2.11			
12" X 12" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$3.68	5	\$3.05	10	\$3.09		\$3.42			
12" X 18" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$5.60	5	\$4.75	10	\$4.64		\$5.42			
12" X 36" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$10.41	5	\$9.15	10	\$9.27		\$9.69			
18" X 18" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$7.81	5	\$6.86	10	\$6.95		\$7.73			
18" X 30" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$13.01	5	\$11.43	10	\$11.59		\$12.11			
24" X 8" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$4.63	5	\$4.09	10	\$4.12		\$4.71			
24" X 10" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$5.78	5	\$5.09	10	\$5.15		\$5.88			
24" X 18" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$10.41	5	\$9.15	10	\$9.27		\$9.69			
24" X 24" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$13.88	5	\$12.20	10	\$12.36		\$12.92			
24" X 30" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$17.35	5	\$15.25	10	\$15.45		\$16.15			
30" X 30" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$21.69	5	\$19.06	10	\$19.31		\$20.19			
30" X 36" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$26.03	5	\$22.87	10	\$23.18		\$24.23			
36" X 36" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$31.23	5	\$27.44	10	\$27.81		\$29.07			
48" X 30" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$34.70	5	\$30.49	10	\$30.90		\$32.30			
48" X 24" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$27.76	5	\$24.39	10	\$24.72		\$25.84			
48" X 48" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$55.52	5	\$48.79	10	\$49.44		\$51.68			
12" X 6" Face Only EGP	\$0.59	10	\$3.00	10	\$0.47		\$0.47			
24" X 30" Face Only EGP	\$5.90	10	\$4.66	10	\$4.70		\$4.70			
30" X 30" Face Only EGP	\$7.38	10	\$5.82	10	\$5.88		\$5.88			
30" X 36" Face Only EGP	\$8.85	10	\$6.99	10	\$7.05		\$7.05			
36" X 36" Face Only EGP	\$10.62	10	\$8.39	10	\$8.46		\$8.46			
48" X 24" Face Only EGP	\$9.44	10	\$7.45	10	\$7.52		\$7.52			
36" X 48" X 48" No Passing Zone Wood Sign EGP	\$29.49	5	\$24.60	10	No Bid		No Bid			

DESCRIPTION	Rathco		Dornbos		Osburn Associates		Vulcan Signs			
12" X 6" Aluminum Sign HIP	\$2.66	5	\$3.00	10	\$1.78		\$2.29			
12" X 12" Aluminum Sign HIP	\$4.12	5	\$3.59	10	\$3.56		\$3.42			
12" X 18" Aluminum Sign HIP	\$6.41	5	\$5.39	10	\$5.34		\$5.86			
12" X 36" Aluminum Sign HIP	\$11.91	5	\$10.78	10	\$10.68		\$10.80			
18" X 18" Aluminum Sign HIP	\$8.93	5	\$8.09	10	\$8.01		\$8.49			
18" X 30" Aluminum Sign HIP	\$14.89	5	\$13.48	10	\$13.35		\$7.35			
21" X 15" Aluminum Sign HIP	\$8.68	5	\$7.87	10	\$7.76		\$7.88			
24" X 6" Aluminum Sign HIP	\$4.04	5	\$3.59	10	\$3.56		\$5.19			
24" X 12" Aluminum Sign HIP	\$7.94	5	\$7.19	10	\$7.12		\$7.74			
24" X 18" Aluminum Sign HIP	\$11.91	5	\$10.78	10	\$10.68		\$10.80			
24" X 24" Aluminum Sign HIP	\$15.88	5	\$14.37	10	\$14.24		\$14.40			
24" X 30" Aluminum Sign HIP	\$19.85	5	\$17.97	10	\$17.79		\$18.00			
30" X 12" Aluminum Sign HIP	\$9.93	5	\$8.98	10	\$8.90		\$9.00			
30" X 30" Aluminum Sign HIP	\$24.81	5	\$22.46	10	\$22.24		\$22.50			
30" X 36" Aluminum Sign HIP	\$29.78	5	\$26.95	10	\$26.70		\$27.00			
36" X 18" Aluminum Sign HIP	\$17.87	5	\$16.17	10	\$16.02		\$16.20			
36" X 36" Aluminum Sign HIP	\$35.73	5	\$32.34	10	\$32.04		\$32.40			
48" X 30" Aluminum Sign HIP	\$39.70	5	\$35.94	10	\$35.60		\$36.00			
48" X 24" Aluminum Sign HIP	\$31.76	5	\$28.75	10	\$28.48		\$28.80			
48" X 48" Aluminum Sign HIP	\$63.52	5	\$57.50	10	\$56.96		\$57.60			
30" Stop Aluminum Sign HIP	\$23.50	5	\$20.72	10	\$21.38		\$21.82			
36" Stop Aluminum Sign HIP	\$33.84	5	\$28.16	10	\$30.78		\$42.17			
36" Stop Ahead Aluminum Sign HIP	\$39.26	5	\$36.05	10	\$32.76		\$34.56			
36" Signal Ahead Aluminum Sign HIP	\$36.31	5	\$36.05	10	\$32.76		\$34.56			
36" Yield Aluminum Sign HIP	\$17.06	5	\$16.17	10	\$16.02		\$15.61			
36" Yield Ahead Aluminum Sign HIP	\$39.26	5	\$36.05	10	\$32.76		\$34.56			
36" X 48" X 48" No Passing Zone Aluminum Sign HIP	\$36.31	5	\$21.56	10	\$43.68		\$29.78			

DESCRIPTION	Rathco		Dornbos		Osburn Associates		Vulcan Signs			
36" Round RR Advance Aluminum Sign HIP	\$35.28	5	\$27.35	10	\$32.04		\$31.07			
24" M1-1 Route Marker Aluminum Sign HIP	\$16.84	5	\$14.37	10	\$14.24		\$20.87			
36" M1-1 Route Marker Aluminum Sign HIP	\$37.89	5	\$32.34	10	\$32.04		\$49.34			
12" X 6" Face Only HIP	\$0.82	10	\$3.75	10	\$0.69		\$0.73			
12" X 36" Face Only HIP	\$4.53	10	\$4.43	10	\$4.11		\$4.38			
18" X 30" Face Only HIP	\$5.66	10	\$5.54	10	\$5.14		\$5.48			
24" X 18" Face Only HIP	\$4.53	10	\$4.43	10	\$4.11		\$4.38			
24" X 30" Face Only HIP	\$7.55	10	\$7.38	10	\$6.85		\$7.30			
30" X 30" Face Only EG	\$9.44	10	\$9.23	10	\$8.56		\$9.13			
30" X 36" Face Only EG	\$11.33	10	\$11.07	10	\$10.28		\$10.95			
36" X 36" Face Only EG	\$13.59	10	\$13.29	10	\$12.33		\$13.14			
48" X 24" Face Only EG	\$12.08	10	\$11.81	10	\$10.96		\$11.68			
30" Stop Face Only EG	\$9.44	10	\$9.23	10	\$8.56		\$9.13			
36" Stop Face Only HIP	\$13.59	10	\$13.29	10	\$12.33		\$13.14			
36" Stop Ahead Face Only HIP	\$18.88	10	\$13.29	10	\$13.32		\$14.67			
36" Signal Ahead Face Only HIP	\$18.88	10	\$13.29	10	\$13.32		\$14.67			
48" X 24" Wood Sign HIP	\$37.84	5	\$46.37	6	No Bid		No Bid			
48" X 30" Wood Sign HIP	\$47.30	5	\$57.96	6	No Bid		No Bid			
48" X 36" Wood Sign HIP	\$56.76	5	\$69.55	6	No Bid		No Bid			
48" X 48" Wood Sign HIP	\$75.68	5	\$92.73	6	No Bid		No Bid			
96" X 48" Wood Sign HIP	\$151.36	5	\$185.47	6	No Bid		No Bid			
36" X 48" X 48" No Passing Zone Wood Sign HIP	\$36.31	5	\$27.88	6	No Bid		No Bid			
12" X 6" Aluminum Sign DG	\$3.25	5	\$4.50	10	\$2.27		\$2.94			
12" X 12" Aluminum Sign DG	\$5.25	5	\$4.71	10	\$4.54		\$5.06			
12" X 18" Aluminum Sign DG	\$7.95	5	\$7.07	10	\$6.81		\$7.07			
12" X 36" Aluminum Sign DG	\$15.00	5	\$14.14	10	\$13.62		\$14.34			
18" X 18" Aluminum Sign DG	\$11.25	5	\$10.61	10	\$10.22		\$11.67			

DESCRIPTION	Rathco		Dornbos		Osburn Associates		Vulcan Signs			
18" X 30" Aluminum Sign DG	\$18.75	5	\$17.68	10	\$17.03		\$17.93			
21" X 15" Aluminum Sign DG	\$10.94	5	\$10.32	10	\$9.90		\$10.46			
24" X 6" Aluminum Sign DG	\$5.05	5	\$4.71	10	\$4.54		\$5.06			
24" X 12" Aluminum Sign HIP	\$10.00	5	\$9.43	10	\$9.08		\$10.38			
24" X 18" Aluminum Sign DG	\$15.00	5	\$14.14	10	\$13.62		\$14.34			
24" X 24" Aluminum Sign DG	\$20.00	5	\$18.85	10	\$18.16		\$19.12			
24" X 30" Aluminum Sign DG	\$25.00	5	\$23.57	10	\$22.70		\$23.90			
30" X 12" Aluminum Sign DG	\$12.50	5	\$11.78	10	\$11.35		\$11.95			
30" X 30" Aluminum Sign DG	\$31.50	5	\$29.46	10	\$28.38		\$29.88			
30" X 36" Aluminum Sign DG	\$37.80	5	\$35.35	10	\$34.05		\$35.85			
36" X 18" Aluminum Sign DG	\$22.68	5	\$21.21	10	\$20.43		\$21.51			
36" X 36" Aluminum Sign DG	\$45.36	5	\$42.42	10	\$40.86		\$43.02			
48" X 24" Aluminum Sign DG	\$40.32	5	\$37.71	10	\$36.32		\$38.24			
48" X 30" Aluminum Sign DG	\$49.30	5	\$47.14	10	\$45.40		\$47.80			
48" X 48" Aluminum Sign DG	\$80.64	5	\$93.81	10	\$72.64		\$76.48			
60" X 36" Aluminum Sign DG	\$73.50	5	\$89.27	10	\$68.10		\$71.70			
30" Stop Aluminum Sign DG	\$30.44	5	\$27.72	10	\$27.94		\$29.12			
36" Stop Aluminum Sign DG	\$43.83	5	\$38.24	10	\$40.23		\$42.17			
36" Stop Ahead Aluminum Sign DG	\$53.68	5	\$50.18	10	\$41.31		\$45.09			
36" Signal Ahead Aluminum Sign DG	\$53.96	5	\$50.18	10	\$41.31		\$45.09			
36" Yield Ahead Aluminum Sign DG	\$53.68	5	\$57.08	10	\$41.31		\$45.09			
36" X 48" X 48" No Passing Zone Aluminum Sign DG	\$42.75	5	\$28.28	10	\$27.54		\$37.40			
36" School DG	\$45.00	5	\$37.77	10	\$41.78		\$41.40			
Notes:										

LAPEER COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2017-7/Part 2 Posts

ITEMS	RATHCO	QTY	DORNBOS	QTY	MD Solutions	QTY	Vulcan Signs	QTY
	269-323-0153		517-543-4000		614-873-2222		800-633-6845	
Green U Type, 12', 3 LB	19.80	*	19.30		20.28	*****	28.37	**
Galv U Type, 12', 3 LB	24.84	*	23.25		25.44	*****	34.81	**
Green U Type, 13', 3 LB	21.45	*	20.89		21.97	*****	No Bid	**
Green U Type, 14', 3 LB	23.10	*	22.53		23.66	*****	No Bid	**
Galv U Type, 14', 3 LB	28.98	*	27.00		29.68	*****	40.61	**
Green U Type, 16', 3 LB	26.40	*	25.60		27.04	*****	No Bid	**
Galv U Type, 16', 3 LB	33.12	*	30.72		33.92	*****	No Bid	**
Galv U Type, 18', 3 LB	37.26	*	34.56		38.16	*****	No Bid	**
Galv U Type, 20', 3 LB	41.40	*	38.40		42.40	*****	No Bid	**
Green U Type 7', 1.12 LB	4.60	*	5.00		5.69	*****	6.18	**
Galv U Type 7', 1.12 LB	5.95	*	6.43		7.35	*****	7.58	**
Green U Type 7', 1.33 LB	No Bid		No Bid		5.90	*****	No Bid	**
Single Crystal Delineator	1.20	****	1.25		1.00		0.70	**
Single Green Delineator	1.20	****	1.35		1.00		0.70	**
Single Red Delineator	1.20	****	1.35		1.00		0.70	**
*Flex Delin. 6' yellow w/3"x6" yellow	22.00	****	19.95		23.00		11.25	**
*Flex Delin. 6' yellow w/3"x4" green	22.00	****	19.95		23.00		11.95	**
Casonite Road Marker CRM-375 or Equal								

Details

*** Bundles of 100

**** Any mix of 200

**Vulcan Signs - Combined min order of 1,000lbs

*Rathco - posts 3lb bundel of 50, 1.12 delineator bundel 100 minimum 42,000 ounds truck load any mix

*****MD Solutions - posts ordered in a minimum of 20,000lbs or freight is additional

LAPEER COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2017-7/Part 3

ITEMS	Rathco	QTY	Dornbos	QTY	Osburn Associates	DTY	MD Solutions	QTY	Vulcan Signs	QTY
	269-323-0153		517-543-4000		800-523-8917		614-873-2222		800-633-6845	
Road Name Sign Blank 9X24 Flat (One Side Covered)	\$5.51		\$5.37		\$5.46	HIP	\$7.25		5.24/6.10	EGP/HIP
Road Name Sign Blank 9X30 Flat (One Side Covered)	\$7.07		\$6.74		\$6.83	HIP	\$9.50		6.44/7.51	EGP/HIP
Road Name Sign Blank 9X36 Flat (One Side Covered)	\$8.48		\$8.07		\$8.19	HIP	\$11.25		7.70/8.98	EGP/HIP
Road Name Sign Blank 9X42 Flat (One Side Covered)	\$9.90		\$9.44		\$9.54	HIP	\$13.25		8.93/10.42	EGP/HIP
Reflective Sheeting 9"X50 yards (Pressure Sensitive)	\$118.13		\$178.42		\$132.75	HIP	No Bid		\$103.16	EGP
Reflective Sheeting 12"X50 yards (Pressure Sensitive)	\$157.13		\$228.75		\$177.00	HIP	No Bid		\$137.55	EGP
Non Reflective Sheeting-Black 9"X50 yards (PS)	\$154.13		\$152.10		\$102.38	Vinyl	No Bid		\$158.30	
Reflective Barricade Sheeting, Orange/Silver 12"X50 yards (PS)	\$240.00		\$356.40		\$231.00	HIP	No Bid		\$185.19	EGP
Temp. Pavement Marking, (Yellow) 4"X50 yards (PS)	\$68.00		\$78.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Temp. Pavement Marking, (White) 4"X50 yards (PS)	\$68.00		\$78.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Temporary Chip Seal Overlay Marker	\$0.70	Box of 500	\$0.77		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
GALV SQ TUBING WITH HOLES 1"X 24"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
GALV SQ TUBING WITH HOLES 1.25" X 30"	No Bid		\$9.15		No Bid		\$4.00		No Bid	
GALV SQ TUBING WITH HOLES 1.75" X 9'	No Bid		\$20.54		No Bid		\$2.25		No Bid	
TUBE CUTTING CHARGE	No Bid		\$0.75		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Sign Post Delineator 3"X48", Yellow, HIP	\$6.50		\$6.50		\$4.24		No Bid		\$5.65	
Sign Post Delineator 3"X48", Red, HIP	\$6.50		\$6.50		\$4.24		No Bid		\$5.65	
Sign Post Delineator 3"X48", White, HIP	\$6.50		\$6.50		\$4.24		No Bid		\$5.65	
Sign Post Delineator 3"X48", Yellow, DG	\$7.88		\$7.75		\$5.34		No Bid		\$6.50	
TYPE II BARRICADES	\$41.00		\$39.50		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
TYPE III BARRICADES	\$195.00		\$185.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	

Vulcan Signs - Combined min. order of 500lbs