

## LAPEER COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

### 2016 - 2 Bituminous Mix Materials

ITEMS	Ace-Saginaw Paving Co.	Ajax Materials Corp.	Cadillac Asphalt
	Kari Wilcox	Brian Borich	Duane Gaedick
	810-238-1737	248-244-3337	586-203-2616
<b>PLANT MIX 1100A</b>	Per Ton	Per Ton	Per Ton
PICKED UP	\$49.50	\$53.50	NO BID
FOB LAPEER	\$57.25	\$73.50	NO BID
FOB NB	\$58.50	\$75.00	NO BID
FOB IC	\$58.25	\$73.50	NO BID
<b>UPM</b>			
PICKED UP	NB	\$102.00	\$115.00
FOB LAPEER	NB	\$103.50	\$124.00
FOB NB	NB	\$103.50	\$124.00
FOB IC	NB	\$105.25	\$124.00
<b>QPR 2000</b>			
PICKED UP	\$90.00		
FOB LAPEER	\$98.44		
FOB NB	\$97.44		
FOB IC	\$99.59		
<b>Alternate</b>		SPM	Pave 192
PICKED UP		\$92.00	\$105.00
FOB LAPEER		\$93.00	\$114.00
FOB NB		\$93.00	\$114.00
FOB IMLAY		\$95.00	\$114.00
	* Pick up location is A3 - Burton *		
	QPR - 50 ton min. if load is split for		
	more than one location add \$2 per ton		