

LAPEER COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2016 - 1 BITUMINOUS MATERIALS ITEMS

Company	Asphalt Materials, Inc	Bit Mat Products	Michigan Paving
Contact	Clarence Brooks	Gary Chapman	Frank Azzopardi
Phone	419-693-0626	989-684-0341	734-322-1934
ITEMS			
HFRS-2	1.8421	2.1668	2.2500
HFRS-2M	2.2421	2.4668	2.5500
SS1H	2.142	2.3668	2.2000
SPECIALTY ITEMS:			
PEP	1.9421	2.4168	No Bid
CSS 1H	2.2421	No Bid	No Bid
AE 90	1.8421	2.2616	No Bid
CRS-2M	No Bid	No Bid	2.6000

