

LAPEER COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2018-7/Part 3

ITEMS			Osburn Associates		MD Solutions		Vulcan Signs	
			Dornbos	QTY	DTY	QTY	QTY	QTY
			517-543-4000	800-523-8917	614-873-2222	800-633-6845		
Road Name Sign Blank 9X24 Flat (One Side Covered)			\$5.56	\$5.76		No Bid	5.36/5.91	EGP/HIP
Road Name Sign Blank 9X30 Flat (One Side Covered)			\$6.93	\$7.20		No Bid	6.59/7.27	EGP/HIP
Road Name Sign Blank 9X36 Flat (One Side Covered)			\$8.34	\$8.64		No Bid	7.88/8.71	EGP/HIP
Road Name Sign Blank 9X42 Flat (One Side Covered)			\$9.72	\$10.06		No Bid	9.14/10.09	EGP/HIP
Reflective Sheeting 9"X50 yards (Pressure Sensitive)			\$152.54	\$131.63		No Bid	\$104.63	EGP
Reflective Sheeting 12"X50 yards (Pressure Sensitive)			\$203.40	\$175.50		No Bid	\$139.50	EGP
Non Reflective Sheeting-Black 9"X50 yards (PS)			\$141.74	\$117.00		No Bid	\$96.41	
Reflective Barricade Sheeting, Orange/Silver 12"X50 yards (PS)			\$365.40	\$246.00		No Bid	\$175.78	EGP
Temp. Pavement Marking, (Yellow) 4"X50 yards (PS)			\$78.00	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
Temp. Pavement Marking, (White) 4"X50 yards (PS)			\$78.00	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
Temporary Chip Seal Overlay Marker			\$0.77	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
GALV SQ TUBING WITH HOLES 1"X 24"			\$6.27	No Bid		\$8.95	No Bid	
GALV SQ TUBING WITH HOLES 1.25" X 30"			\$9.41	No Bid		\$4.75	No Bid	
GALV SQ TUBING WITH HOLES 1.75" X 9'			\$19.56	No Bid		\$2.75	No Bid	
TUBE CUTTING CHARGE			\$0.75	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
Sign Post Delineator 3"X48", Yellow, HIP			\$6.50	\$5.25		No Bid	\$4.95	
Sign Post Delineator 3"X48", Red, HIP			\$6.50	\$5.25		No Bid	\$4.95	
Sign Post Delineator 3"X48", White, HIP			\$6.50	\$5.25		No Bid	\$4.95	
Sign Post Delineator 3"X48", Yellow, DG			\$7.75	\$7.48		No Bid	\$5.95	
TYPE II BARRICADES			\$39.50	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
TYPE III BARRICADES			\$169.85	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	

Dornbos - Sign Minimum Order \$1500

Vulcan Signs - Combined min. order of 500lbs