

## LAPEER COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

### 2018-7/Part 2 Posts

ITEMS	QTY	DORNBOS		MD Solutions		Vulcan Signs	
		QTY		QTY		QTY	
		517-543-4000		614-873-2222		800-633-6845	
Green U Type, 12', 3 LB		20.84	50	20.26	***	29.92	**
Galv U Type, 12', 3 LB		27.50	50	26.07	***	38.98	**
Green U Type, 13', 3 LB		22.58	50	21.95	***	32.41	**
Green U Type, 14', 3 LB		24.32	50	23.63	***	34.90	**
Galv U Type, 14', 3 LB		32.08	50	30.41	***	45.48	**
Green U Type, 16', 3 LB		27.79	50	27.01	***	39.89	**
Galv U Type, 16', 3 LB		36.67	50	34.75	***	51.98	**
Galv U Type, 18', 3 LB		44.49	50	39.10	***	59.02	**
Galv U Type, 20', 3 LB		49.44	50	43.44	***	64.97	**
Green U Type 7', 1.12 LB		4.89	100	5.45	***	6.87	**
Galv U Type 7', 1.12 LB		6.75	100	7.22	***	8.67	**
Green U Type 7', 1.33 LB		No Bid	-	5.45	***	No Bid	**
Single Crystal Delineator		1.25	100	No Bid		0.75	**
Single Green Delineator		1.35	100	No Bid		0.75	**
Single Red Delineator		1.35	100	No Bid		0.75	**
*Flex Delin. 6' yellow w/3"x6" yellow		19.95	25	No Bid		11.25	**
*Flex Delin. 6' yellow w/3"x4" green		19.95	25	No Bid		11.95	**
Casonite Road Marker CRM-375 or Equal							

#### Details

\*Dornbos Post min order of \$5000

\*\*Vulcan Signs - Combined min order of 1,000lbs

\*\*\*MD Solutions - posts ordered in a minimum of 20,000lbs or freight is additional