

LAPEER COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2018-7 Signs/Part 1

ITEM	Dornbos		Osburn Associates		Vulcan Signs			
	517-543-4000		740-385-6869		800-633-6845			
	UNIT\$	MIN	UNIT\$	MIN	UNIT\$	MIN		
12" X 6" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$1.66	10	\$1.67		\$2.10			
12" X 12" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$3.32	10	\$3.34		\$3.58			
12" X 18" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$4.97	10	\$5.01		\$5.05			
12" X 36" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$9.95	10	\$10.02		\$9.42			
18" X 18" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$7.46	10	\$7.52		\$7.46			
18" X 30" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$12.43	10	\$12.53		\$11.78			
24" X 8" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$4.44	10	\$4.46		\$4.65			
24" X 10" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$5.54	10	\$5.57		\$5.73			
24" X 18" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$9.95	10	\$10.02		\$9.42			
24" X 24" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$13.26	10	\$13.36		\$12.56			
24" X 30" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$16.58	10	\$16.70		\$15.70			
30" X 30" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$20.72	10	\$20.88		\$19.63			
30" X 36" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$24.87	10	\$25.05		\$23.55			
36" X 36" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$29.84	10	\$30.06		\$28.26			
48" X 30" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$33.15	10	\$33.40		\$31.40			
48" X 24" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$26.52	10	\$26.72		\$25.12			
48" X 48" Aluminum Sign EGP	\$53.05	10	\$53.44		\$50.24			
12" X 6" Face Only EGP	\$0.48	10	\$0.54		\$0.65			
24" X 30" Face Only EGP	\$4.78	10	\$5.40		\$4.40			
30" X 30" Face Only EGP	\$5.97	10	\$6.75		\$5.50			
30" X 36" Face Only EGP	\$7.17	10	\$8.10		\$6.60			
36" X 36" Face Only EGP	\$8.60	10	\$9.72		\$7.92			
48" X 24" Face Only EGP	\$7.65	10	\$8.64		\$7.04			
36" X 48" X 48" No Passing Zone Wood Sign EGP	\$25.04	10	No Bid		No Bid			

DESCRIPTION		Dornbos		Osburn Associates		Vulcan Signs			
12" X 6" Aluminum Sign HIP		\$1.86	10	\$1.92		\$2.30			
12" X 12" Aluminum Sign HIP		\$3.73	10	\$3.84		\$4.05			
12" X 18" Aluminum Sign HIP		\$5.59	10	\$5.76		\$5.23			
12" X 36" Aluminum Sign HIP		\$11.18	10	\$11.52		\$10.80			
18" X 18" Aluminum Sign HIP		\$8.39	10	\$8.64		\$8.46			
18" X 30" Aluminum Sign HIP		\$13.98	10	\$14.40		\$13.50			
21" X 15" Aluminum Sign HIP		\$8.16	10	\$8.37		\$8.43			
24" X 6" Aluminum Sign HIP		\$3.73	10	\$3.84		\$3.93			
24" X 12" Aluminum Sign HIP		\$7.45	10	\$7.68		\$7.64			
24" X 18" Aluminum Sign HIP		\$11.18	10	\$11.52		\$10.80			
24" X 24" Aluminum Sign HIP		\$14.91	10	\$15.36		\$14.40			
24" X 30" Aluminum Sign HIP		\$18.63	10	\$19.20		\$18.00			
30" X 12" Aluminum Sign HIP		\$9.32	10	\$9.60		\$8.72			
30" X 30" Aluminum Sign HIP		\$23.29	10	\$24.00		\$22.50			
30" X 36" Aluminum Sign HIP		\$27.95	10	\$28.80		\$27.00			
36" X 18" Aluminum Sign HIP		\$16.77	10	\$17.28		\$16.20			
36" X 36" Aluminum Sign HIP		\$33.54	10	\$34.56		\$32.40			
48" X 30" Aluminum Sign HIP		\$37.27	10	\$38.40		\$36.00			
48" X 24" Aluminum Sign HIP		\$29.81	10	\$30.72		\$28.80			
48" X 48" Aluminum Sign HIP		\$59.63	10	\$61.44		\$57.60			
30" Stop Aluminum Sign HIP		\$22.16	10	\$22.38		\$21.62			
36" Stop Aluminum Sign HIP		\$31.86	10	\$32.23		\$31.00			
36" Stop Ahead Aluminum Sign HIP		\$36.97	10	\$34.56		\$33.82			
36" Signal Ahead Aluminum Sign HIP		\$36.97	10	\$34.56		\$34.25			
36" Yield Aluminum Sign HIP		\$16.77	10	\$17.28		\$15.29			
36" Yield Ahead Aluminum Sign HIP		\$36.97	10	\$34.56		\$33.82			
36" X 48" X 48" No Passing Zone Aluminum Sign HIP		\$22.36	10	\$30.72		\$28.55			

DESCRIPTION			Dornbos		Osburn Associates		Vulcan Signs		
36" Round RR Advance Aluminum Sign HIP			\$30.79	10	\$34.56		\$30.73		
24" M1-1 Route Marker Aluminum Sign HIP			\$14.91	10	\$15.36		\$20.99		
36" M1-1 Route Marker Aluminum Sign HIP			\$33.54	10	\$34.56		\$50.67		
12" X 6" Face Only HIP			\$0.68	10	\$0.79		\$0.90		
12" X 36" Face Only HIP			\$4.10	10	\$4.74		\$4.26		
18" X 30" Face Only HIP			\$5.13	10	\$5.93		\$5.33		
24" X 18" Face Only HIP			\$4.10	10	\$4.74		\$4.26		
24" X 30" Face Only HIP			\$6.84	10	\$7.90		\$7.10		
30" X 30" Face Only EG			\$8.55	10	\$9.88		\$8.88		
30" X 36" Face Only EG			\$10.25	10	\$11.85		\$10.65		
36" X 36" Face Only EG			\$12.31	10	\$14.22		\$12.78		
48" X 24" Face Only EG			\$10.94	10	\$12.64		\$11.36		
30" Stop Face Only EG			\$8.55	10	\$9.58		\$8.88		
36" Stop Face Only HIP			\$12.31	10	\$13.98		\$12.78		
36" Stop Ahead Face Only HIP			\$15.72	10	\$14.22		\$13.66		
36" Signal Ahead Face Only HIP			\$15.72	10	\$14.22		\$14.11		
48" X 24" Wood Sign HIP			\$36.78	6	No Bid		No Bid		
48" X 30" Wood Sign HIP			\$45.98	6	No Bid		No Bid		
48" X 36" Wood Sign HIP			\$55.18	6	No Bid		No Bid		
48" X 48" Wood Sign HIP			\$73.57	6	No Bid		No Bid		
96" X 48" Wood Sign HIP			\$183.92	6	No Bid		No Bid		
36" X 48" X 48" No Passing Zone Wood Sign HIP			\$27.59	6	No Bid		No Bid		
12" X 6" Aluminum Sign DG			\$2.56	10	\$2.53		\$2.95		
12" X 12" Aluminum Sign DG			\$5.12	10	\$5.05		\$5.30		
12" X 18" Aluminum Sign DG			\$7.68	10	\$7.58		\$7.49		
12" X 36" Aluminum Sign DG			\$15.35	10	\$15.15		\$14.34		
18" X 18" Aluminum Sign DG			\$11.51	10	\$11.36		\$11.09		

DESCRIPTION		Dornbos		Osburn Associates		Vulcan Signs			
18" X 30" Aluminum Sign DG		\$19.19	10	\$18.94		\$17.93			
21" X 15" Aluminum Sign DG		\$11.21	10	\$11.01		\$10.84			
24" X 6" Aluminum Sign DG		\$5.12	10	\$5.05		\$5.14			
24" X 12" Aluminum Sign HIP		\$10.23	10	\$10.10		\$9.90			
24" X 18" Aluminum Sign DG		\$15.35	10	\$15.15		\$14.34			
24" X 24" Aluminum Sign DG		\$20.47	10	\$20.20		\$19.12			
24" X 30" Aluminum Sign DG		\$25.58	10	\$25.25		\$23.90			
30" X 12" Aluminum Sign DG		\$12.79	10	\$12.63		\$12.38			
30" X 30" Aluminum Sign DG		\$31.98	10	\$31.56		\$29.88			
30" X 36" Aluminum Sign DG		\$38.38	10	\$37.88		\$35.85			
36" X 18" Aluminum Sign DG		\$23.03	10	\$22.73		\$21.51			
36" X 36" Aluminum Sign DG		\$46.05	10	\$45.45		\$43.02			
48" X 24" Aluminum Sign DG		\$40.93	10	\$40.40		\$38.24			
48" X 30" Aluminum Sign DG		\$51.17	10	\$50.50		\$47.80			
48" X 48" Aluminum Sign DG		\$98.89	10	\$80.80		\$76.48			
60" X 36" Aluminum Sign DG		\$94.09	10	\$75.75		\$71.70			
30" Stop Aluminum Sign DG		\$30.16	10	\$31.48		\$28.93			
36" Stop Aluminum Sign DG		\$43.38	10	\$45.38		\$41.41			
36" Stop Ahead Aluminum Sign DG		\$52.94	10	\$45.45		\$44.23			
36" Signal Ahead Aluminum Sign DG		\$52.94	10	\$45.45		\$44.66			
36" Yield Ahead Aluminum Sign DG		\$52.94	10	\$45.45		\$44.23			
36" X 48" X 48" No Passing Zone Aluminum Sign DG		\$30.70	10	\$40.40		\$35.91			
36" School DG		\$42.47	10	\$45.45		\$41.81			
Notes:		*Sign minimum order \$1500 *Post min. order \$5000				*500lb minimum order			

